
ClassifiedsClassifieds Phone: 619-441-1440
Fax: 619-426-6346

Deadline: Wednesday at 9 a.m.

SELL IT QUICK CLASSIFIED FORM
One item, two weeks, three lines published absolutely FREE in The East County Californian & Alpine Sun!

Items for sale must be $100 or less.
Please use ink. Ads are limited to one item, three lines and will run for two weeks. Ads will run only as space permits.

One ad per household per week. No commercial or automotive ads.
Start with name of item.  One letter per box. Leave space between words and after punctuation.

Please submit your form in person, by fax or mail. NO phone calls accepted for “Sell It Quick” ads.
DeADLINe: 4 P.m. TUeSDAY

Mail or deliver in person to: Sell It Quick • 2144 Alpine Blvd., Alpine, CA 91901 • Fax to: (619) 441-0020
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NEW BUSINESS?
Renewing Your Business Name?

Publish Your

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 

FOR AS LITTLE AS
$41 FOR ALL 4 WEEKS

Once you file with us ... you’re done!
file by fax, mail, email or walk-in

2144 Alpine Blvd., Alpine • 445-3288
staff@thealpinesun.com • Fax 445-6776

(FBNs are non-refundable)

Having A Garage Sale?
Make it a BIG EVENT for just $5

Get up to
15 lines
with a
border

Call today!
441-1440
       some restrictions 

       may apply

Legal Notices-ALPINE
SUMMONS

(CITACION JUDICIAL)
CASE NUMBER

(Numero del Caso)
37-2019-00037137-

CU-MC-CTL
NOTICE TO

DEFENDANT:
(Aviso al Demandado):

TINA DAILY, and
DOES 1 through 10

YOU ARE BEING
SUED BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando

el demandante)
ANDREW GEORGE

NOTICE! You have
been sued. The court
may decide against
you without your being
heard unless you re-
spond within 30 days.
Read the information
below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this sum-
mons and legal papers
are served on you to
file a written response
at this court and have a
copy served on the
plainti f f . A letter or
phone call will not pro-
tect you. Your written
response must be in
proper legal form if you
want the court to hear
your case. There may
be a court form that
you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts On-
line Self-Help Center
(www. courtinfo.ca.gov/
selfhelp), your county
law library, or the court-
house nearest you. If
you cannot pay the fil-
ing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver
form. If you do not file
your response on time,
you may lose the case
by default, and your
wages, money, and
property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal
requirements. You may
want to call an attor-
ney right away. If you
do not know an attor-
ney, you may want to
call an attorney refer-
ral service. If you can-
not afford an attorney,
you may be eligible for
free legal services from
a nonprofit legal ser-
vices program. You
can locate these non-
profit groups at the
California Legal Ser-
v i c e s W e b s i t e
(www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-
H e l p C e n t e r
( w w w . c o u r t i n f o . c a .
gov/selfhelp), or by
contacting your local
court of county bar as-
sociation. NOTE: The
court has a statutory li-
en for waived fees and
costs on any settle-
ment or arbi t rat ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case.
The court's lien must
be paid before the
court will dismiss the
case.
AVISO! Lo han de-
mandado. Si no re-
sponde dentro de 30
dias, la corte puede de-
cidir en su contra sin
escuchar su version.
Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que
le en t reg uen es ta
citacion y papeles le-
gales para presentar
una respuesta por es-
crito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue
una copia al demand-
ante. Una carta o una
llamada telefonica no
l o p r o t e g e n . S u
respuesta por escrito
t iene que estar en
formato legal correcto
si desea que procesen
su caso en la corte. Es
posible que haya un
formularlo que usted
pueda usar su re-
puesta. Puede encon-
trar estos formularios
de la corte y mas in-
formacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cor-
t e s d e C a l i f o r n i a
(www.sucorte.ca.gov),
en la bibl ioteca de
leyes de su condado o
en la corte que le
quede mas cerca. Si
no puede pagar la
cuota de presentacion,
pida al secretario de la
corte que le de un for-
mularlo de exencion de
pago de cuotas. Si no
presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede per-
der el caso por incump-
limiento y la corte le
podra quitar su sueldo,
dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomend-
able que llame a un
abogado inmediata-
mente. Si no conoce a
un abogado, puede
llamar a un servicio de
remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible
que cumpla con los re-
quisitos para obtener
servicios legales gratui-
tos de un programa de
servicios legales sin
fines de lucro. Puede
encontrar estos grupos
sin fines de lucro en el
sitio web de California
L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,
org), en el Centro de
Ayunda de las Cortes
de California, (www.su-
c o r t e . c a . g o v ) o
poniendose en con-
tacto con la corte o el
colegio de abogados
locales. AVISO! Por
ley , la cor te t iene
derecho a reclamar las
cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cu-
alquier recuperacion de
$10,000.00 o mas de
valor recibida medi-
ante un acuerdo o una
concesion de arbitraje
en un caso de derecho
civil. Tiene que pagar
el gravamen de la corte
antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el
caso.
The name and ad-
dress of the court is (El
nombre y dirección de
la corte es): Superior
Court  of  California,
County of San Diego,
330  West  Broadway,
San Diego, CA 92101.
The name, address,
and telephone number
of plaintiff’s attorney, or
plaintiff without an at-
torney, is (El nombre,
dirección y el número
d e t e l é f o n o d e l
abogado del demand-
ante, o del demand-
ante que no t iene
abogado, es) : AN-
D R E W G E O R G E ,
7472 LA JOLLA BLVD,
LA JOLLA, CA 92037
(619)818-3739
Date: 7/29/2019
Clerk, by (Secretario):
M. Reyes
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You
are served
as an individual de-
fendant.
Statement of Dam-
a g e s : C o s t s o f
$1,080.00 plus Attor-
ney Fees of $1401.50
for a Total of $2,481.50
will be requested by
Plaintiff as a judgment
against Defendant.
Alpine Sun- 89630
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019
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Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028501
Ms. Aislynn Tutoring
Located at : 14220
Powers Rd, Poway, CA
92064. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Aislynn Amber
Daniel, 14220 Powers
Rd, Poway, CA 92064.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Aislynn Am-
ber Daniel
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/27/2019
Alpine Sun - 90688
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028620
Alpine  Sun Massage
L o c a t e d a t : 2 5 3 5
Alpine Blvd, Ste #1,
Alpine, CA 91901. This
business is registered
by the following: Au-
tumn Rou lan , 519
Makenna Ln., Alpine,
CA 91901.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature : Autum n
Roulan
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/02/2019
Alpine Sun - 90690
12/5,12,19,26/2019

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME
CASE NO. 37-2019-

00060586-CU-PT-CTL
TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
R U T H H A N N A H
MOORE filed a peti-
tion with this court for a
d e c r e e c h a n g i n g
names as fo l lows :
R U T H H A N N A H
M O O R E t o R U T H
HANNAH SEVILLA.
T H E C O U R T O R -
DERS that all persons
interested in this mat-
ter shall appear before
this court at the hear-
ing indicated below to
show cause, if any,
why the petit ion for
change of name should
not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes de-
scribed above must file
a written objection that
includes the reasons
for the objection at
least two court days
before the matter is
scheduled to be heard
and must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

JAN 15, 2020
8:30 a.m., Dept. 61

Superior Court
330 W. Broadway

San Diego, CA 92101
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Alpine Sun
DATE: November 15,
2019
Peter C. Deddeh
Judge of the
Superior Court
Alpine Sun - 90691
12/5,12,19,26/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO. 2019-9027840

Big  Country  Foods
located at: 1701 La
Costa Meadows Drive,
S a n M a r c o s , C A
9 2 0 7 8 .
The fictitious business
name referred to above
was filed in San Diego
County on 11/06/2014
and assigned File No.
2014-029405 is aban-
d o n e d b y : G i l l c o
Products, Inc., 1701 La
Costa Meadows Drive,
S a n M a r c o s , C A
9 2 0 7 8 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
Signature: W. M. Gil-
lies, CEO
Statement filed with
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: November 19, 2019
Alpine Sun - 90383
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028467
Blue Cigar Entertain-
ment  Located at: 7320
Black Swan Pl., Carls-
bad, CA 92011. This
business is registered
b y t h e f o l l o w i n g :
theHustl.io LLC, 7320
Black Swan Pl., Carls-
bad, CA 92011.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Seman Ne-
jad, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/26/2019
Alpine Sun - 90559
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028423
PurchaseBucks.com
Located at: 701 Palo-
mar Airport Road, Suite
300, Car lsbad, CA
92011. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: America's Loan
Advisors Inc., 701 Pa-
lomar Airport Roads,
Suite 300, Carlsbad,
CA 92011.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Joel Harris-
on, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/26/2019
Alpine Sun - 90583
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028371
Anza  Metal  Works
Located at: 2826 Pion-
eer Way, Jamul, CA
91935. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Donnell Victor
Blasi, 2826 Pioneer
W a y , J a m u l , C A
9 1 9 3 5 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was:11/25/2019
Signature: Donnell Vic-
tor Blasi
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/25/2019
Alpine Sun - 90586
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027439
Mutiny Labs  Located
at: 1738 1/2 Upas St.,
San Diego, CA 92103.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Kristine Theresa
Angell, 1738 1/2 Upas
St., San Diego, CA
92103.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature : Kr is t ine
Theresa Angel l
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 90589
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028501
Ms. Aislynn Tutoring
Located at : 14220
Powers Rd, Poway, CA
92064. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Aislynn Amber
Daniel, 14220 Powers
Rd, Poway, CA 92064.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Aislynn Am-
ber Daniel
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/27/2019
Alpine Sun - 90688
12/5,12,19,26/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE
FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027873
Floorlot Flooring Loc-
ated at: 1203 Monterey
Ave, Chula Vista, CA
91911. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Oscar Le Car-
bajal, 1203 Monterey
Ave, Chula Vista, CA
91911.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/10/2014
Signature: Oscar Le
Carbajal
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90198
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO. 2019-9027653

a.  Armor  Home  &
Landscape Pest Con-
trol  b. Armor  Pest
Control located at:
2 5 7 3 T a v e r n R d ,
A lp ine , CA 91901.
The fictitious business
name referred to above
was filed in San Diego
County on 01/22/2015
and assigned File No.
2015-001928 is aban-
doned by: a. Jennifer
Martinez & Louie Mar-
tinez, 2573 Tavern Rd,
Alpine, CA 91901.
This business is con-
ducted by: Marr ied
Couple
Signature: Louie J.
Mart inez
Statement filed with
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: November 15, 2019
Alpine Sun - 90244
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028178
Golden Poppy Events
Located at: 677 Becky
Lane, San Marcos, CA
92069. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Sara Elisabeth
Beveridge, 677 Becky
Lane, San Marcos, CA
92069.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/22/2019
S i g n a t u r e : S a r a
B e v e r i d g e
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/22/2019
Alpine Sun - 90291
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

STATEMENT OF
ABANDONMENT OF
USE OF FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
NO. 2019-9027840

Big  Country  Foods
located at: 1701 La
Costa Meadows Drive,
S a n M a r c o s , C A
9 2 0 7 8 .
The fictitious business
name referred to above
was filed in San Diego
County on 11/06/2014
and assigned File No.
2014-029405 is aban-
d o n e d b y : G i l l c o
Products, Inc., 1701 La
Costa Meadows Drive,
S a n M a r c o s , C A
9 2 0 7 8 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
Signature: W. M. Gil-
lies, CEO
Statement filed with
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: November 19, 2019
Alpine Sun - 90383
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027734
Joy's  Nails  &  Spa
Located at: 2401 Vista
Way Suite C, Ocean-
side, CA 92054. This
business is registered
by the following: Minh
Tam Vo, 4948 Bella
Collina, Oceanside, CA
92056.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/18/2019
Signature: Minh Tam
Vo
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/18/2019
Alpine Sun - 89996
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026893
GRC  Field  Services
Located at: 510 Har-
bison Canyon Rd, El
Cajon, CA 92019. This
business is registered
by the following: Brian
D Barber, 510 Har-
bison Canyon Rd, El
Cajon, CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Br ian D
Barber
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 90079
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027597
Two  Witches  and  a
Broom  Located at:
9658 Marilla Dr. Unit
3 3 , L a k e s i d e , C A
92040. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Amanda Dawn
Dodd, 9658 Marilla Dr.
Unit 33, Lakeside, CA
92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Amanda
Dawn Dodd
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/15/2019
Alpine Sun - 90081
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027788
J & S Recycling Loc-
ated at: 3560 Ashford
Street, San Diego, CA
92111. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: a. Oscar Gian-
carlo Quiroz, b. Denise
Cervantes, 2810 Olive
Street, Lemon Grove,
CA 91945.
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Partnership
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Denise Cer-
vantes
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/18/2019
Alpine Sun - 90208
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027654
 a. Armor  Pest  Con-
trol b. Armor Home &
Landscape Pest Con-
trol  Located at: 1157
Hamlet St., El Cajon,
CA 92021. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Luis Jose
Martinez, 1157 Hamlet
S t . , E l Ca jon , CA
92021 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/22/2015
Signature: Luis Jose
Martinez
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/15/2019
Alpine Sun - 90243
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026145
Eat Sober Located at:
2934 Babbling Brook
Rd., Chula Vista, CA
91914. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : S p e c i a l t y
Foods International Inc,
2934 Babbling Brook
Rd., Chula Vista, CA
91914.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S igna tu re : And re s
Camberos , CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/28/2019
Alpine Sun - 89855
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027219
Haz inu  Market ing
Located at: 6265 Rose
St, San Diego, CA
92115. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Adam Howard
Simon, 6265 Rose St,
San Diego, CA 92115.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 08/01/2019
S i g n a t u r e : A d a m
H o w a r d S i m o n
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/08/2019
Alpine Sun - 89936
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026649
Sun Garden Consult-
ing  Located at: 4018
Marlesta Drive, San
Diego, CA 92111. This
business is registered
by the following: Ed-
ward F. Woch, 4018
Marlesta Drive, San
Diego, CA 92111.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 04/23/2016
Signature: Edward F.
Woch
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 89990
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026798
Children's  Learning
Center   Located at:
5000 Willows Road,
Alpine, CA 91901. This
business is registered
by the following: Chil-
dren's Learning Center,
5000 Willows Road,
Alpine, CA 91901.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Terri M Ber-
casio, CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 89993
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027734
Joy's  Nails  &  Spa
Located at: 2401 Vista
Way Suite C, Ocean-
side, CA 92054. This
business is registered
by the following: Minh
Tam Vo, 4948 Bella
Collina, Oceanside, CA
92056.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/18/2019
Signature: Minh Tam
Vo
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/18/2019
Alpine Sun - 89996
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026657
Busy  L i t t l e  Bees
Cleaning Located at:
9194 Pinkard Lane, El
Cajon, CA 92021. This
business is registered
by the following: Tan-
y a J e w e l l M a r i e
O ' s h e a .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/01/2018
S i g n a t u r e : T a n y a
O ' s h e a
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 89788
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026660
Gil lco  Ingredients
Located at: 1701 La
Costa Meadows Drive,
S a n M a r c o s , C A
92078. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Gillco Products,
Inc., 1701 La Costa
Meadows Drive, San
Marcos, CA 92078.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 07/11/2011
Signature: Willard M.
Gillies, Owner/CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 89838
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026899
San  Diego  Wine  &
Culinary  Event  Cen-
ter Located at: 200
Harbor Drive Suite 120,
San Diego, CA 92101.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Wine & Culinary
Services, Inc., 200 Har-
bor Drive, Suite 120,
San Diego, CA 92101.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 02/08/2013
Signature : Mary J .
Robinson, Secretary
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/06/2019
Alpine Sun - 89840
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026144
Sober Located at :
2934 Babbling Brook
Rd., Chula Vista, CA
91914. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : S p e c i a l t y
Foods International Inc,
2934 Babbling Brook
Rd., Chula Vista, CA
91914.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S igna tu re : And res
Camberos , CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/28/2019
Alpine Sun - 89853
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026145
Eat Sober Located at:
2934 Babbling Brook
Rd., Chula Vista, CA
91914. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : S p e c i a l t y
Foods International Inc,
2934 Babbling Brook
Rd., Chula Vista, CA
91914.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S igna tu re : And res
Camberos , CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/28/2019
Alpine Sun - 89855
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)
37-2019-00037137-

CU-MC-CTL
NOTICE TO

DEFENDANT:
(Aviso al Demandado):

TINA DAILY, and
DOES 1 through 10

YOU ARE BEING
SUED BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando

el demandante)
ANDREW GEORGE

NOTICE! You have
been sued. The court
may decide against
you without your being
heard unless you re-
spond within 30 days.
Read the information
below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this sum-
mons and legal papers
are served on you to
file a written response
at this court and have a
copy served on the
plainti f f . A letter or
phone call will not pro-
tect you. Your written
response must be in
proper legal form if you
want the court to hear
your case. There may
be a court form that
you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts On-
line Self-Help Center
(www. courtinfo.ca.gov/
selfhelp), your county
law library, or the court-
house nearest you. If
you cannot pay the fil-
ing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver
form. If you do not file
your response on time,
you may lose the case
by default, and your
wages, money, and
property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal
requirements. You may
want to call an attor-
ney right away. If you
do not know an attor-
ney, you may want to
call an attorney refer-
ral service. If you can-
not afford an attorney,
you may be eligible for
free legal services from
a nonprofit legal ser-
vices program. You
can locate these non-
profit groups at the
California Legal Ser-
v i c e s W e b s i t e
(www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-
H e l p C e n t e r
( w w w . c o u r t i n f o . c a .
gov/selfhelp), or by
contacting your local
court of county bar as-
sociation. NOTE: The
court has a statutory li-
en for waived fees and
costs on any settle-
ment or arbi t rat ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case.
The court's lien must
be paid before the
court will dismiss the
case.
AVISO! Lo han de-
mandado. Si no re-
sponde dentro de 30
dias, la corte puede de-
cidir en su contra sin
escuchar su version.
Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que
le en t reguen es ta
citacion y papeles le-
gales para presentar
una respuesta por es-
crito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue
una copia al demand-
ante. Una carta o una
llamada telefonica no
l o p r o t e g e n . S u
respuesta por escrito
t iene que estar en
formato legal correcto
si desea que procesen
su caso en la corte. Es
posible que haya un
formularlo que usted
pueda usar su re-
puesta. Puede encon-
trar estos formularios
de la corte y mas in-
formacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cor-
t e s d e C a l i f o r n i a
(www.sucorte.ca.gov),
en la bibl ioteca de
leyes de su condado o
en la corte que le
quede mas cerca. Si
no puede pagar la
cuota de presentacion,
pida al secretario de la
corte que le de un for-
mularlo de exencion de
pago de cuotas. Si no
presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede per-
der el caso por incump-
limiento y la corte le
podra quitar su sueldo,
dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomend-
able que llame a un
abogado inmediata-
mente. Si no conoce a
un abogado, puede
llamar a un servicio de
remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible
que cumpla con los re-
quisitos para obtener
servicios legales gratui-
tos de un programa de
servicios legales sin
fines de lucro. Puede
encontrar estos grupos
sin fines de lucro en el
sitio web de California
L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,
org), en el Centro de
Ayunda de las Cortes
de California, (www.su-
c o r t e . c a . g o v ) o
poniendose en con-
tacto con la corte o el
colegio de abogados
locales. AVISO! Por
ley , la cor te t iene
derecho a reclamar las
cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cu-
alquier recuperacion de
$10,000.00 o mas de
valor recibida medi-
ante un acuerdo o una
concesion de arbitraje
en un caso de derecho
civil. Tiene que pagar
el gravamen de la corte
antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el
caso.
The name and ad-
dress of the court is (El
nombre y dirección de
la corte es): Superior
Court  of  California,
County of San Diego,
330  West  Broadway,
San Diego, CA 92101.
The name, address,
and telephone number
of plaintiff’s attorney, or
plaintiff without an at-
torney, is (El nombre,
dirección y el número
d e t e l é f o n o d e l
abogado del demand-
ante, o del demand-
ante que no t iene
abogado, es) : AN-
D R E W G E O R G E ,
7472 LA JOLLA BLVD,
LA JOLLA, CA 92037
(619)818-3739
Date: 7/29/2019
Clerk, by (Secretario):
M. Reyes
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You
are served
as an individual de-
fendant.
Statement of Dam-
a g e s : C o s t s o f
$1,080.00 plus Attor-
ney Fees of $1401.50
for a Total of $2,481.50
will be requested by
Plaintiff as a judgment
against Defendant.
Alpine Sun- 89630
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026657
Busy  L i t t l e  Bees
Cleaning Located at:
9194 Pinkard Lane, El
Cajon, CA 92021. This
business is registered
by the following: Tan-
y a J e w e l l M a r i e
O ' s h e a .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/01/2018
S i g n a t u r e : T a n y a
O ' s h e a
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 89788
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

SUMMONS
(CITACION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)
37-2019-00037137-

CU-MC-CTL
NOTICE TO

DEFENDANT:
(Aviso al Demandado):

TINA DAILY, and
DOES 1 through 10

YOU ARE BEING
SUED BY PLAINTIFF:
(Lo esta demandando

el demandante)
ANDREW GEORGE

NOTICE! You have
been sued. The court
may decide against
you without your being
heard unless you re-
spond within 30 days.
Read the information
below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this sum-
mons and legal papers
are served on you to
file a written response
at this court and have a
copy served on the
plainti f f . A letter or
phone call will not pro-
tect you. Your written
response must be in
proper legal form if you
want the court to hear
your case. There may
be a court form that
you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts On-
line Self-Help Center
(www. courtinfo.ca.gov/
selfhelp), your county
law library, or the court-
house nearest you. If
you cannot pay the fil-
ing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver
form. If you do not file
your response on time,
you may lose the case
by default, and your
wages, money, and
property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal
requirements. You may
want to call an attor-
ney right away. If you
do not know an attor-
ney, you may want to
call an attorney refer-
ral service. If you can-
not afford an attorney,
you may be eligible for
free legal services from
a nonprofit legal ser-
vices program. You
can locate these non-
profit groups at the
California Legal Ser-
v i c e s W e b s i t e
(www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-
H e l p C e n t e r
( w w w . c o u r t i n f o . c a .
gov/selfhelp), or by
contacting your local
court of county bar as-
sociation. NOTE: The
court has a statutory li-
en for waived fees and
costs on any settle-
ment or arbi t rat ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case.
The court's lien must
be paid before the
court will dismiss the
case.
AVISO! Lo han de-
mandado. Si no re-
sponde dentro de 30
dias, la corte puede de-
cidir en su contra sin
escuchar su version.
Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que
le en t reguen es t a
citacion y papeles le-
gales para presentar
una respuesta por es-
crito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue
una copia al demand-
ante. Una carta o una
llamada telefonica no
l o p r o t e g e n . S u
respuesta por escrito
t iene que estar en
formato legal correcto
si desea que procesen
su caso en la corte. Es
posible que haya un
formularlo que usted
pueda usar su re-
puesta. Puede encon-
trar estos formularios
de la corte y mas in-
formacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cor-
t e s d e C a l i f o r n i a
(www.sucorte.ca.gov),
en la bibl ioteca de
leyes de su condado o
en la corte que le
quede mas cerca. Si
no puede pagar la
cuota de presentacion,
pida al secretario de la
corte que le de un for-
mularlo de exencion de
pago de cuotas. Si no
presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede per-
der el caso por incump-
limiento y la corte le
podra quitar su sueldo,
dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomend-
able que llame a un
abogado inmediata-
mente. Si no conoce a
un abogado, puede
llamar a un servicio de
remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible
que cumpla con los re-
quisitos para obtener
servicios legales gratui-
tos de un programa de
servicios legales sin
fines de lucro. Puede
encontrar estos grupos
sin fines de lucro en el
sitio web de California
L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,
org), en el Centro de
Ayunda de las Cortes
de California, (www.su-
c o r t e . c a . g o v ) o
poniendose en con-
tacto con la corte o el
colegio de abogados
locales. AVISO! Por
ley , la cor te t iene
derecho a reclamar las
cuotas y los costos ex-
entos por imponer un
gravamen sobre cu-
alquier recuperacion de
$10,000.00 o mas de
valor recibida medi-
ante un acuerdo o una
concesion de arbitraje
en un caso de derecho
civil. Tiene que pagar
el gravamen de la corte
antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el
caso.
The name and ad-
dress of the court is (El
nombre y dirección de
la corte es): Superior
Court  of  California,
County of San Diego,
330  West  Broadway,
San Diego, CA 92101.
The name, address,
and telephone number
of plaintiff’s attorney, or
plaintiff without an at-
torney, is (El nombre,
dirección y el número
d e t e l é f o n o d e l
abogado del demand-
ante, o del demand-
ante que no t iene
abogado, es) : AN-
D R E W G E O R G E ,
7472 LA JOLLA BLVD,
LA JOLLA, CA 92037
(619)818-3739
Date: 7/29/2019
Clerk, by (Secretario):
M. Reyes
Deputy (Adjunto)
NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You
are served
as an individual de-
fendant.
Statement of Dam-
a g e s : C o s t s o f
$1,080.00 plus Attor-
ney Fees of $1401.50
for a Total of $2,481.50
will be requested by
Plaintiff as a judgment
against Defendant.
Alpine Sun- 89630
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019
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Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027774
a. It's  All  About  Me
Now  b. Iaam  Now
Located at: 8415 La
Mesa Blvd St. #3, La
Mesa, CA 91942. This
business is registered
by the fol lowing: a.
Melody Eues, 980 E
Main St. Unit C, El Ca-
jon , CA 92021, b .
CeCe Canton, 4251
Wood land Dr . , La
Mesa , CA 91941 .
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Partnership
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/18/2019
S igna tu re : Me lod y
Eues
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/18/2019
Alpine Sun - 89977
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026250
Sportline  Auto   Loc-
ated at: 926 Grand
Ave, Spring Valley, CA
91977. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Laith J Shosh-
ani, 3578 Hidden Trail
D r i v e , J a m u l , C A
9 1 9 3 5 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/29/2019
Signa tu re : La i th J
Shoshan i
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/29/2019
Alpine Sun - 89978
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026249
Palm City Liquor  Loc-
ated at: 688 Hollister
St., San Diego, CA
92154. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Laith J Shosh-
ani, 3578 Hidden Trail
D r i v e , J a m u l , CA
9 1 9 3 5 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/29/2019
Signa tu re : La i th J
Shoshan i
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/29/2019
Alpine Sun - 89979
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027400
a. Primal  Scenes  b.
Primal Scenes Rock-
N-Roll   Located at:
4245 N. Cordoba Ave,
Spr ing Va l ley , CA
91977. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Jessica Lynn
Buddell, 4245 N. Cor-
doba Ave, Spring Val-
ley, CA 91977.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/13/2019
Signature : Jess ica
Lynn Budde l l
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 90002
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027843
Lamborgimpy  Loc-
ated at: 4848 71st
Street, San Diego, CA
92115. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Donna Gae
Shepard, 4848 71st
Street, San Diego, CA
92115.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/10/2019
Signature: Donna Gae
Shepard
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90011
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027435
Day One Credit  Loc-
ated at: 9265 Dowdy
Drive, Suite 228, San
Diego, CA 92126. This
business is registered
b y t h e f o l l o w i n g :
Project 17, LLC, 9265
Dowdy Drive, Suite
228, San Diego, CA
92126.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: 2/26/2019
Signature: Denis Gu-
sakov, Presidnent
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 89888
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027555
Elite Parking Enforce-
ment  Located at: 205
Claydelle Ave, Suite
102, El Cajon, CA
92020. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : Y o u s i f
Alyadako, 901 Salina
S t , E l C a j o n , C A
9 2 0 2 0 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/14/2019
S i g n a t u r e : Y o u s i f
A l y a d a k o
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/14/2019
Alpine Sun - 89895
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027652
Clean Earth Mainten-
ance  Systems   Loc-
ated at: 1282 Fayette
Street, El Cajon, CA
92020. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Clean Earth
Carpet, Inc., 1282 Fay-
ette Street, El Cajon,
CA 92020.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S i g n a t u r e : R o b y n
S u k a t s k i
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/15/2019
Alpine Sun - 89900
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027445
Solidarity  Van  and
Storage  Co   Located
at: 2537 Arcadia Ave,
Lemon Grove , CA
91945. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Dean Dalton
Freeman, 2537 Arca-
dia Ave, Lemon Grove,
CA 91945 & Sharon
Lee Freeman, 3143
Peg Leg Mine Rd.,
Jamul, CA 91935.
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Partnership
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/01/1965
Signature: Dean Dalton
Freeman
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 89934
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027774
a. It's  All  About  Me
Now  b. Iaam  Now
Located at: 8415 La
Mesa Blvd St. #3, La
Mesa, CA 91942. This
business is registered
by the fol lowing: a.
Melody Eues, 980 E
Main St. Unit C, El Ca-
jon , CA 92021, b .
CeCe Canton, 4251
Wood land Dr . , L a
Mesa , CA 91941 .
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Partnership
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/18/2019
S igna tu re : Me lody
Eues
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/18/2019
Alpine Sun - 89977
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027051
Cloud Surveillance &
Security   Located at:
1326 Darby St., Spring
Valley, CA 91977. This
business is registered
by the following: Dustin
Todd Cloud , 1326
Darby St., Spring Val-
ley, CA 91977.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Dustin Todd
Cloud
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/07/2019
Alpine Sun - 89799
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027436
Sky  Market   Located
at: 1904 E Palomar St
Ste 108, Chula Vista,
CA 91913. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: SE Fam-
ily Inc, 1904 E Palo-
mar St Ste 108, Chula
Vista, CA 91913.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/01/2019
Signature: Saher B
Hanna, CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 89816
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9025896
Pure  Shine  Window
Cleaning  Located at:
4302 Palm Ave. Unit
7 1 , L a M e s a , C A
91941. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: a. Joseph Arel-
lano, 4302 Palm Ave.
Unit 71, La Mesa, CA
91941, b. Hunter Mar-
t in Fenn, 6831 Al-
varado Rd. Unit 8, La
Mesa, CA 92120, c.
Gray Rohde, 18515
Camini to Pasadero
#352, San Diego, CA
92128.
This business is con-
ducted by: Co-Partners
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Joseph Arel-
lano
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/24/2019
Alpine Sun - 89828
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027581
LiT La Mesa  Located
at: 7729 Universi ty
Ave., La Mesa, CA
91942. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: La Mesa Health
Center, Inc., 7729 Uni-
versity Ave., La Mesa,
CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Vanessa
Naimi, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/14/2019
Alpine Sun - 89886
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027435
Day One Credit  Loc-
ated at: 9265 Dowdy
Drive, Suite 228, San
Diego, CA 92126. This
business is registered
b y t h e f o l l o w i n g :
Project 17, LLC, 9265
Dowdy Drive, Suite
228, San Diego, CA
92126.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: 2/26/2019
Signature: Denis Gu-
sakov, Presidnent
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 89888
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026395
Seabright  Assisted
Living  and  Memory
Care  Located at: 831
Santa Regina, Solana
Beach, CA 92075. This
business is registered
by the following: Alara
Health Services Inc.,
5053 Plaza Promen-
ade, San Diego, CA
92123.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/30/2019
S i g n a t u r e : S a h e r
C h o u d r y , C E O
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/30/2019
Alpine Sun - 90521
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027472
Strong Base Jiu Jitsu
Academy  Located at:
663 Palomar Street Ste
6C, Chula Vista, CA
91911. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Silvia Gabriela
Ramirez, 1662 Dahlia
Ave, San Diego, CA
92154.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Silvia Gabri-
ela Ramirez
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 90805
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027349
Cool  Cleaning  Ser-
vices   Located at :
3295 Meade Ave, San
Diego, CA 92116. This
business is registered
by the following: Jean
Elise Durandisse, 8750
Mellmanor Dr. #45, La
Mesa, CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/12/2019
Signature: Jean Elise
Durandisse
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/12/2019
Alpine Sun - 89781
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027406
Inhale  Smoke  Shop
L o c a t e d a t : 9 5 2 3
Jamacha Blvd, Spring
Valley, CA 91977. This
business is registered
by the following: En-
hale Smoke Shop Inc.,
9523 Jamacha Blvd,
Spr ing Va l ley , CA
91977 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 08/01/2019
Signature: Nael Yo-
hana, CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/13/2019
Alpine Sun - 89797
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027051
Cloud Surveillance &
Security   Located at:
1326 Darby St., Spring
Valley, CA 91977. This
business is registered
by the following: Dustin
Todd Cloud , 1326
Darby St., Spring Val-
ley, CA 91977.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Dustin Todd
Cloud
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/07/2019
Alpine Sun - 89799
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029122
a. Netta's  Bakery  b.
VJG  Unlimited  Loc-
ated at: 1923 Fern-
brook Ct., El Cajon, CA
92019. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : V e n n e t t a
Gamble, 1923 Fern-
brook Ct., El Cajon, CA
92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/09/2019
Signature: Vennetta
Gamble
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/09/2019
Alpine Sun - 90929
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

ARTICLES OF
INCORPORATION OF
Sitzmark Strategies

Filed August 27, 2019
4311792

ONE: The name of this
corporation is Sitzmark
Strategies.
TWO: The purpose of
this corporation is to
engage in any lawful
act or activity for which
a corporation may be
organized under the
General Corporation
Law of California other
than the banking busi-
ness, the trust com-
pany business or the
practice of a profes-
sion permitted to be in-
corporated by the Cali-
fornia Corporat ions
Code.
THREE: The name and
address in the State of
California of this cor-
poration’s initial agent
for service of process
is:

Andrew Ewald
6759 Palermi Place
Carlsbad, CA 92011

FOUR: The initial busi-
ness and mailing ad-
dress of the Corpora-
tion is:

6759 Palermi Place
Carlsbad, CA 92011

FIVE: This Corpora-
tion is authorized to is-
sue only one class of
stock, which shall be
designated common
stock, and the total
number o f shares ,
which this corporation
is authorized to issue,
is Ten Thousand.
SIX: The liability of the
director of the corpora-
tion for monetary dam-
ages shall be elimin-
ated to the fullest ex-
tent permissible under
California Law.
SEVEN: The Corpora-
tion is authorized to in-
demnify the directors
and officers of the cor-
poration to the fullest
extent permissible un-
der California Law.
August 14, 2019

(Signature of
Incorporator)

Andrew Ewald
Alpine Sun- 90971
12/12/19

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9025813
G P Metal Restorator
Located at : 520 N
Quince St, Escondido,
CA 92025. This busi-
ness is registered by
the fo l lowing: Ser-
vando Moralez Car-
rera, 767 Jefferson St
#B, Chula Vista, CA
91914.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Servando
Moralez Carrera
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/24/2019
Alpine Sun - 89837
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026395
Seabright  Assisted
Living  and  Memory
Care  Located at: 831
Santa Regina, Solana
Beach, CA 92075. This
business is registered
by the following: Alara
Health Services Inc.,
5053 Plaza Promen-
ade, San Diego, CA
92123.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/30/2019
S i g n a t u r e : S a h e r
C h o u d r y , C E O
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 10/30/2019
Alpine Sun - 90521
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028351
Next Generation Con-
struction  Located at:
8480 Via Sanoma #22,
La Jolla, CA 92037.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Alvord Enterprises,
Inc., 8480 Via Sonoma
#22, La Jo l la , CA
92037.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/04/2019
S i g n a t u r e : S c o t t
A l v o r d , P r e s i d e n t
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/25/2019
Alpine Sun - 90861
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028943
a. Biz  Books  b. Pink
Bubbly  Events   Loc-
ated at: 4141 Wabash
Ave Apt 5, San Diego,
CA 92104. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Bethany
Quinn Smith, 4141 Wa-
bash Ave Apt 5, San
Diego, CA 92104.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/02/2019
Signature: Bethany
Quinn Smith
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 90904
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029066
The Chicago  Located
at: 5663 Balboa Av
#439, San Diego, CA
92111. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Issam Al bar-
barawi, 5663 Balboa
Av #439, San Diego,
CA 92111.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Issam Al
barbarawi
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/06/2019
Alpine Sun - 90917
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028389
Unleashed  by  Petco
#2161  Loca ted a t :
2435 Del Mar Heights
Road, Ste. D5, San
Diego, CA 92130. This
business is registered
by the following: Petco
A n i m a l S u p p l i e s
Stores, Inc., 10850 Via
Frontera, San Diego,
CA 92127.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/01/2014
Signature : Richard
S k e e n , A s s i s t a n t
T r e a s u r e r
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/26/2019
Alpine Sun - 90925
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029122
a. Netta's  Bakery  b.
VJG  Unlimited  Loc-
ated at: 1923 Fern-
brook Ct., El Cajon, CA
92019. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : V e n n e t t a
Gamble, 1923 Fern-
brook Ct., El Cajon, CA
92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/09/2019
Signature: Vennetta
Gamble
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/09/2019
Alpine Sun - 90929
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028659
Zhen  Wu  Wellness
Located at : 12170
Camino Rio, Lakeside,
CA 92040. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Seldom
A . M c G e e , 1 2 1 7 0
Camino Rio, Lakeside,
CA 92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 6/1/2019
Signa tu re : Se ldom
McGee
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/02/2019
Alpine Sun - 90821
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028927
Go Eastman  Located
at: 1842 49th St, San
Diego, CA 92102. This
business is registered
by the fol lowing: a.
Donald Richard East-
man b. Jennifer Jean
Eastman, 1842 49th St,
San Diego, CA 92102.
This business is con-
ducted by: Marr ied
Couple
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S igna tu re : Dona l d
R icha rd Eas tman
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 90822
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028813
Health  and  Freedom
Located at: 10545 Dar-
well Court, San Diego,
CA 92126. This busi-
ness is registered by
t h e f o l l o w i n g : a .
Rowena Cruz Murray
b . Joseph Mur ray ,
10545 Darwell Court,
San Diego, CA 92126.
This business is con-
ducted by: Marr ied
Couple
The first day of busi-
ness was: 3/4/2012
Signature: Rowena
Cruz Murray
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90823
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029031
Sumit Medical Trans-
portation  Located at:
4041 Oak Crest Dr
#202, San Diego, CA
92105. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Legit Express
LLC, 4041 Oak Crest
Dr #202, San Diego,
CA 92105.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Abdi Shak-
ur Nuuh, CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/06/2019
Alpine Sun - 90854
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028351
Next Generation Con-
struction  Located at:
8480 Via Sanoma #22,
La Jolla, CA 92037.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Alvord Enterprises,
Inc., 8480 Via Sonoma
#22, La Jo l la , CA
92037.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/04/2019
S i g n a t u r e : S c o t t
A l v o r d , P r e s i d e n t
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/25/2019
Alpine Sun - 90861
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE
FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028445
ACDC   Located at:
7940 Si lverton Ave
#102, San Diego, CA
92126. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Micbar Hold-
ings LLC, 7940 Silver-
ton Ave #102, San
Diego, CA 92126.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S i g n a t u r e : B a r r y
Schechter, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/26/2019
Alpine Sun - 90642
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028460
O s b o r n e  G e n e r a l
Contracting  Located
at: 13339 Wellington
Hill Drive, Lakeside,
CA 92040. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Timothy
John Osborne, 13339
Wellington Hill Drive,
Lakeside, CA 92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/26/2019
Signature: T imothy
John Osborne
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/26/2019
Alpine Sun - 90711
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028861
Hidden  Valley  Glass
L o c a t e d a t : 1 7 2 9
Flower St., Escondido,
CA 92027. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Angel Ar-
t u r o R o c i o , 1 7 2 9
Flower St., Escondido,
CA 92027.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Angel Ar-
turo Rocio
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 90799
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028264
Toast ik  &  Cheers
Located at: 7275 Char-
mant Drive 323, San
Diego, CA 92122. This
business is registered
by the following: Ren-
ata Batsevitsky, 7275
Charmant Drive 323,
San Diego, CA 92122.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Renata Bat-
sevitsky
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/22/2019
Alpine Sun - 90816
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028659
Zhen  Wu  Wellness
Located at : 12170
Camino Rio, Lakeside,
CA 92040. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Seldom
A . M c G e e , 1 2 1 7 0
Camino Rio, Lakeside,
CA 92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 6/1/2019
Signa tu re : Se ldom
McGee
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/02/2019
Alpine Sun - 90821
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20
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Legal Notices-ALPINE
FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029103
JCJ Productions  Loc-
ated at: 2313 Double-
tree Road, Spring Val-
ley, CA 91978. This
business is registered
by the following: John
Charles Clark Jr., 2313
D o u b l e t r e e R o a d ,
Spr ing Va l ley , CA
91978 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 08/01/2005
S i g n a t u r e : J o h n
C h a r l e s C l a r k J r .
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/09/2019
Alpine Sun - 90894
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029083
V i l l a g e  P l a n n i n g
Group   Located at:
1128 E Washington
Ave Apt D, El Cajon,
CA 92019. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: James G
Renzi & Barbara J
Renzi, 1128 E Wash-
ington Ave Apt D, El
Cajon, CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Marr ied
Couple
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/28/2012
Signature: James G
Renzi
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/09/2019
Alpine Sun - 90920
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029159
Bechthold Construc-
tion  Located at: 13158
Casa Grande Ave,
Lakeside, CA 92040.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Gregory Steven
Bechthold, 13158 Casa
Grande Ave, Lakeside,
CA 92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/9/2019
Signature: Gregory
Steven Bechthold
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/09/2019
Alpine Sun - 90938
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028069
a. Aunty  Emo's  Kit-
chen & Grill b. Aunty
Emo's   Located at:
4320 Parks Avenue,
Unit G, La Mesa, CA
91941. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : L o w e M .
Leasau & Leemo G.
Leasau, 4320 Parks
Avenue, Unit G, La
Mesa, CA 91941.
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Partnership
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/01/2019
Signature: Lowe M.
Leasau
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/21/2019
Alpine Sun - 90959
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028644
QcCubed  Incorpor-
ated  Located at: 3545
Midway Drive Ste P,
San Diego, CA 92110.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: QcCubed Incorpor-
ated, 3545 Midway
D r i v e S t e P , S a n
D iego , CA 92110 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 7/18/2018
S igna tu re : E r i c A .
S t a u b e s ,
P r e s i d e n t / C E O
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/02/2019
Alpine Sun - 90831
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028972
Golden  Foods   Loc-
ated at: 11265 Car-
roza Ct., San Diego,
CA, 92124. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Joseph
Carl Peterson, 11265
C a r r o z a C t . , S a n
D iego , CA 92124 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 06/15/1994
Signature: Joseph Carl
Peterson
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 90835
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028807
Vivendi  Realty   Loc-
ated at: 9001 Gross-
mont Blvd #715, La
Mesa, CA 91941. This
business is registered
by the following: Ana
Ruth Chavarria, 10650
Canyon Grove Trail
#17, San Diego, CA
92130.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Ana Ruth
Chavarria
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90857
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9029089
Ashton's  P izzer ia
L o c a t e d a t : 2 4 1 0
Fletcher Parkway, El
Cajon, CA 92020. This
business is registered
b y t h e f o l l o w i n g :
Sandro Isaac, 862 S.
Mollison Ave Apt #17,
El Cajon, CA 92020.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/09/2019
S igna tu re : Sandr o
Isaac
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/09/2019
Alpine Sun - 90892
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028912
Herba Succurro  Loc-
ated at : 11340 Sir
Francis Drake Dr, La
Mesa, CA 91941. This
business is registered
by the following: Suc-
curro Inc., 11340 Sir
Francis Drake Dr, La
Mesa, CA 91941.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/10/2019
Signature: E l l ie R.
Amirona, CEO
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 90893
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028709
David  A's  Estate  &
Antiques  Located at:
8806 La Mesa Blvd, La
Mesa, CA 91942. This
business is registered
by the following: Glyn-
nis R. Aguirre, 9120
Brier Rd, La Mesa, CA
91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/03/2019
Signature: Glynnis R.
Aguirre
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90780
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028829
Red  Ta i led  Hawk
Designs   Located at:
2039 Akuunyaa Way,
Lakeside, CA 92040.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Antoinette Christ-
man, 2039 Akuunyaa
Way, Lakeside, CA
92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/04/2019
Signature: Antoinette
Christman
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 90781
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028874
Rancho  San  Diego
Emus  -  RSD  Emus
Located at: 1768 Hid-
den Mesa Rd, El Ca-
jon, CA 92019. This
business is registered
by the following: Willi
Al lan Seeger, 1768
Hidden Mesa Rd, El
Cajon, CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/22/1992
Signature: Willi Allan
Seeger
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 90802
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028940
Tiger's  Towing   Loc-
ated at: 524 Chambers
St. #C, El Cajon, CA
92020. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : R a n d e e
Akoobi, 524 Chambers
St. #C, El Cajon, CA
92020.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature : Randee
Akoob i
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/05/2019
Alpine Sun - 90820
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028644
QcCubed  Incorpor-
ated  Located at: 3545
Midway Drive Ste P,
San Diego, CA 92110.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: QcCubed Incorpor-
ated, 3545 Midway
D r i v e S t e P , S a n
D iego , CA 92110 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 7/18/2018
S igna tu re : E r i c A .
S t a u b e s ,
P r e s i d e n t / C E O
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/02/2019
Alpine Sun - 90831
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE
FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028094
Legacy Children Ser-
vices   Located at :
7608 El Paso St, La
Mesa, CA 91942. This
business is registered
b y t h e f o l l o w i n g :
Michell Bautista, 7608
El Paso St, La Mesa,
CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
S igna tu re : M iche l l
Bau t i s ta
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/21/2019
Alpine Sun - 90615
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027876
EN2CO   Located at:
1349 Wooden Valley
St., Chula Vista, CA
91913. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Youngjin Lee,
1349 Wooden Valley
St., Chula Vista, CA
91913.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/19/2019
Signature: Youngjin
Lee
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90748
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028789
Budget Painters  Loc-
ated at: 1110 Delaware
St., Imperial Beach, CA
91932. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : A r m a n d o
G o m e z , 1 1 1 0
Delaware St., Imperial
Beach, CA 91932.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 6/1/2019
Signature: Armando
Gomez
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90749
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028707
David  A's  Certified
Appraisal  Services
Located at: 8806 La
Mesa Blvd, La Mesa,
CA 91942. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: David J.
Aguirre, 9120 Brier Rd,
La Mesa, CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/03/2019
Signature: David J .
Aguirre
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90767
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028709
David  A's  Estate  &
Antiques  Located at:
8806 La Mesa Blvd, La
Mesa, CA 91942. This
business is registered
by the following: Glyn-
nis R. Aguirre, 9120
Brier Rd, La Mesa, CA
91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/03/2019
Signature: Glynnis R.
Aguirre
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90780
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027887
SBB  Medical  Billing
L o c a t e d a t : 2 1 5 3
Greencrest Dr., El Ca-
jon, CA 92019. This
business is registered
by the following: Shel-
i ta B. Brady, 2153
Greencrest Dr., El Ca-
jon, CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/01/2019
Signature: Shelita B
Brady
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90328
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028336
a. El  Camino  Flower
Shop  b. El  Camino
Miramar  Florist  c. El
Camino  Memor ia l
Park  Flower  Shop d.
El  Camino  Miramar
Flowers   Located at:
5600 Carroll Canyon
Rd, San Diego, CA
92121. This business is
registered by the fol-
l o w i n g : N e w B l u e
Moon, Inc., 5600 Car-
roll Canyon Rd., San
Diego, CA 92121.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 4/15/1997
Signature: Beverley
Ireland, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/25/2019
Alpine Sun - 90508
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027898
Davalos   Located at:
175 Ruth Ct., El Cajon,
CA 92019. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Fran-
cisco Davalos Junior,
175 Ruth Ct., El Cajon,
CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/19/2019
Signature: Francisco
Davalos Junior
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90553
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028624
W o o d s o n  R e a l t y
Group   Located at:
8274 La Mesa Blvd, La
Mesa, CA, 91942. This
business is registered
by the following: Wood-
son Realty Inc., 8274
La Mesa Blvd , La
Mesa, CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 12/2/2019
S i g n a t u r e : D a v i d
Robert Woodson, Pres-
ident
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/02/2019
Alpine Sun - 90692
12/5,12,19,26/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028736
a.  Blackout  Tinting
SD b. On Point Social
Management   Loc-
ated at: 231 Meadow
Crest Dr., El Cajon, CA
92020. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Joshua Eric
Bates, 231 Meadow
Crest Dr., El Cajon, CA
92020.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Joshua Eric
Bates
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 12/03/2019
Alpine Sun - 90717
12/12,19,26/19,1/2/20

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028108
Charley  Brown  Chil-
dren's  Center  Loc-
ated at: 5921 Jackson
Dr . , La Mesa , CA
91942. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: United Church
of Christ of La Mesa,
5940 Kelton Ave., La
Mesa, CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 05/20/1972
S igna tu re : Rona ld
Young , T reasu re r
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/21/2019
Alpine Sun - 90206
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027571
a. Lupe's  Shoe  Re-
pair  b. Lupe's  Shoe
Service  Located at:
4670 Nebo Dr. Suite
#101, La Mesa, CA
91941. This business is
registered by the fol-
low ing : Er ika Jac-
queline Harris, 7407 Al-
varado Rd. Apt. E, La
Mesa, 91932.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature: Erika Jac-
queline Harris
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/14/2019
Alpine Sun - 90278
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028174
Sharper  Future  Loc-
ated at: 2667 Camino
Del Rio S Suite 305,
San Diego, CA 92108.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Pacific Forensic
P s y c h o l o g y A s s o -
c ia tes , Inc , 19230
Sonoma Hwy Suite
200 , Sonoma , C A
95476 .
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 06/01/1999
S i g n a t u r e : R o b e r t
L o v e l e s s , C F O
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/22/2019
Alpine Sun - 90281
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028270
a. SD  Renta l  Ad-
visors b. SD Realty &
Rental  Advisors c.
Close  Your  Escrow
Located at : 11322
Shadow Ranch Rd, La
Mesa, CA 91941. This
business is registered
by the following: SD
Realty Advisors, 11322
Shadow Ranch Rd, La
Mesa, CA 91941.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/22/2019
Signature: Giovanna
Kajjy, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/22/2019
Alpine Sun - 90311
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027887
SBB  Medical  Billing
L o c a t e d a t : 2 1 5 3
Greencrest Dr., El Ca-
jon, CA 92019. This
business is registered
by the following: Shel-
i ta B. Brady, 2153
Greencrest Dr., El Ca-
jon, CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/01/2019
Signature: Shelita B
Brady
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90328
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027994
Auto Spa Detail  Loc-
ated at: 9538 Carlton
Hills Blvd, Santee, CA
92071. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Roberto Vega,
9538 Carlton Hills Blvd,
Santee, CA 92071.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/20/2003
Signature: Roberto
Vega
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/20/2019
Alpine Sun - 90134
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028232
a.  Agave  Ironworks
b. Agave Iron Located
at: 13110 Ha Hana Rd,
Lakeside, CA 92040.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: Agave Iron, LLC,
13110 Ha Hana Rd,
Lakeside, CA 92040.
This business is con-
ducted by: Limited Li-
ability Company
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/01/2016
Signature: John F.
Mevi , Pres ident
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/22/2019
Alpine Sun - 90135
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027753
a. Light House Secur-
ity Solutions b. LHSS
Located at: 260 Euclid
Ave Apt E, San Diego,
CA 92114. This busi-
ness is registered by
the following: Brandy
Michelle Olson & Geof-
frey Maurice Olson,
1121 Greenfield Dr Apt
3, El Cajon, CA 92021.
This business is con-
ducted by: Marr ied
Couple
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/18/2019
Signature: Geoffrey
Olson
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/18/2019
Alpine Sun - 90190
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028074
MATR  Loca ted a t :
35252 Old Highway 80,
Pine Valley, CA 91962.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: a. Charles Lee
Foster Id le r , 2650
Jamacha Rd. Suite
147, El Cajon, CA
92019, b. Benjamin Al-
len Good, 35252 Old
Highway 80, Pine Val-
ley, CA 91962.
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Partnership
The first day of busi-
ness was: 09/20/2019
Signature: Benjamin
Allen Good
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/21/2019
Alpine Sun - 90196
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9028108
Charley  Brown  Chil-
dren's  Center  Loc-
ated at: 5921 Jackson
Dr . , La Mesa , CA
91942. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: United Church
of Christ of La Mesa,
5940 Kelton Ave., La
Mesa, CA 91942.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 05/20/1972
S igna tu re : Rona l d
Young , T reasu re r
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/21/2019
Alpine Sun - 90206
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

Legal Notices-ALPINE

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027843
Lamborgimpy  Loc-
ated at: 4848 71st
Street, San Diego, CA
92115. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Donna Gae
Shepard, 4848 71st
Street, San Diego, CA
92115.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 11/10/2019
Signature: Donna Gae
Shepard
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/19/2019
Alpine Sun - 90011
11/21,28,12/5,12/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027514
V  &  D  Multiservices
Located at: 1303 S.
Escondido Blvd Ste C,
Escondido, CA 92025.
This business is re-
gistered by the follow-
ing: a. Vitalia Sanchez
N u c a m e n d i , 7 7 0 8
Caminito Liliana, San
Diego, CA 92129, b.
Dora Alvarez , 395
M a g n o l i a A v e , E l
Centro, CA 92243.
This business is con-
ducted by: General
Parntership
The first day of busi-
ness was: N/A
Signature:Vitalia Sanc-
hez Nucamendi
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/14/2019
Alpine Sun - 90045
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9026659
Rancho  San  Diego
Animal Hospital  Loc-
ated at: 2988 Jamacha
Rd. , E l Cajon, CA
92019. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Rancho San
Diego Animal Hospital,
2988 Jamacha Rd., El
Cajon, CA 92019.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 10/01/2001
Signature:Rosanne I.
Brown, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/04/2019
Alpine Sun - 90052
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027974
a. TDC Solar b. Terra
Development & Con-
struction  Located at:
2810 Tucker Tra i l ,
Jamul, CA 91935. This
business is registered
by the following: JPC
Deve lopment , Inc . ,
2810 Tucker Tra i l ,
Jamul , CA 91935.
This business is con-
ducted by: Corporation
The first day of busi-
ness was: 9/4/2018
Signature: John P. Col-
lura, President
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/20/2019
Alpine Sun - 90116
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT NO.

2019-9027994
Auto Spa Detail  Loc-
ated at: 9538 Carlton
Hills Blvd, Santee, CA
92071. This business is
registered by the fol-
lowing: Roberto Vega,
9538 Carlton Hills Blvd,
Santee, CA 92071.
This business is con-
ducted by: Individual
The first day of busi-
ness was: 01/20/2003
Signature: Roberto
Vega
Statement filed with the
Recorder/County Clerk
of San Diego County
on: 11/20/2019
Alpine Sun - 90134
11/28,12/5,12,19/2019


